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Alfred Burrage’s War is War is his sincere and successful attempt to record his experiences as a private
soldier in France during the First World War, his reactions to abnormal conditions and his observations.

Written in the 1920s he wanted the curious to know what war was really like. Burrage realized that nearly all
such memoirs were written by ex-officers who inevitably saw the war from a different view point to Tommy
Atkins – as he put it, the officers ‘were only with us, not of us, and they cannot get inside our skins.’ In this
account, written of necessity under a pseudonym, he covers the wide canvas of war, from off duty moments
in grubby estaminets and brothels, to life in shell torn trenches, going over the top with equally terrified yet
resigned comrades, being a casualty, to periods of numbing boredom.

War is War is superbly crafted and phrased and will be revelation to even the most informed student of The
Great War. Private X writes with complete honesty and avoids sentimentality. How fortunate that he at least
survived his ordeal to share with us nearly 100 years later his thoughts, fears and experiences.
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From reader reviews:

Jean Spence:

This War is War book is absolutely not ordinary book, you have it then the world is in your hands. The
benefit you get by reading this book will be information inside this publication incredible fresh, you will get
data which is getting deeper an individual read a lot of information you will get. This War is War without we
comprehend teach the one who examining it become critical in pondering and analyzing. Don't always be
worry War is War can bring whenever you are and not make your bag space or bookshelves' turn into full
because you can have it with your lovely laptop even cell phone. This War is War having great arrangement
in word as well as layout, so you will not feel uninterested in reading.

Christopher Pipkin:

The reserve with title War is War has a lot of information that you can learn it. You can get a lot of help after
read this book. This specific book exist new knowledge the information that exist in this guide represented
the condition of the world today. That is important to yo7u to learn how the improvement of the world. This
kind of book will bring you in new era of the internationalization. You can read the e-book in your smart
phone, so you can read this anywhere you want.

John Dame:

You will get this War is War by browse the bookstore or Mall. Simply viewing or reviewing it could to be
your solve issue if you get difficulties on your knowledge. Kinds of this e-book are various. Not only by
simply written or printed but additionally can you enjoy this book by simply e-book. In the modern era such
as now, you just looking of your mobile phone and searching what their problem. Right now, choose your
own ways to get more information about your e-book. It is most important to arrange you to ultimately make
your knowledge are still change. Let's try to choose correct ways for you.

Sharon Brogdon:

Do you like reading a publication? Confuse to looking for your chosen book? Or your book seemed to be
rare? Why so many concern for the book? But just about any people feel that they enjoy intended for
reading. Some people likes looking at, not only science book but in addition novel and War is War or others
sources were given knowledge for you. After you know how the truly great a book, you feel desire to read
more and more. Science e-book was created for teacher or maybe students especially. Those ebooks are
helping them to put their knowledge. In various other case, beside science reserve, any other book likes War
is War to make your spare time a lot more colorful. Many types of book like this.
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