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In this third volume of a planned five-volume series, David Roy provides a complete and annotated
translation of the famous Chin P'ing Mei, an anonymous sixteenth-century Chinese novel that focuses on the
domestic life of His-men Ch'ing, a corrupt, upwardly mobile merchant who maintains a harem of six wives
and concubines. This work, known primarily for its erotic realism, is also a landmark in the development of
narrative art--not only from a specifically Chinese perspective but also in a world-historical context.

Written during the second half of the sixteenth century and first published in 1618, The Plum in the Golden
Vase is noted for its surprisingly modern technique. With the possible exception of The Tale of Genji (ca.
1010) and Don Quixote (1605, 1615), there is no earlier work of prose fiction of equal sophistication in
world literature. Although its importance in the history of Chinese narrative has long been recognized, the
technical virtuosity of the author, which is more reminiscent of the Dickens of Bleak House, the Joyce of
Ulysses, or the Nabokov of Lolita than anything in earlier Chinese fiction, has not yet received adequate
recognition. This is partly because all of the existing European translations are either abridged or based on an
inferior recension of the text. This translation and its annotation aim to faithfully represent and elucidate all
the rhetorical features of the original in its most authentic form and thereby enable the Western reader to
appreciate this Chinese masterpiece at its true worth.

Replete with convincing portrayals of the darker side of human nature, it should appeal to anyone interested
in a compelling story, compellingly told.
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From reader reviews:

Richard Martinez:

What do you ponder on book? It is just for students because they're still students or that for all people in the
world, exactly what the best subject for that? Just simply you can be answered for that problem above. Every
person has diverse personality and hobby for every single other. Don't to be pushed someone or something
that they don't want do that. You must know how great in addition to important the book The Plum in the
Golden Vase or, Chin P'ing Mei, Volume Three: The Aphrodisiac: 3 (Princeton Library of Asian
Translations). All type of book is it possible to see on many sources. You can look for the internet solutions
or other social media.

Robert Penrose:

Information is provisions for people to get better life, information currently can get by anyone on
everywhere. The information can be a know-how or any news even restricted. What people must be consider
whenever those information which is inside the former life are difficult to be find than now's taking seriously
which one is acceptable to believe or which one the particular resource are convinced. If you receive the
unstable resource then you have it as your main information there will be huge disadvantage for you. All
those possibilities will not happen in you if you take The Plum in the Golden Vase or, Chin P'ing Mei,
Volume Three: The Aphrodisiac: 3 (Princeton Library of Asian Translations) as the daily resource
information.

Frederick Rothman:

Reading a publication can be one of a lot of exercise that everyone in the world enjoys. Do you like reading
book therefore. There are a lot of reasons why people enjoyed. First reading a guide will give you a lot of
new details. When you read a e-book you will get new information because book is one of a number of ways
to share the information or perhaps their idea. Second, reading a book will make you more imaginative.
When you examining a book especially hype book the author will bring someone to imagine the story how
the personas do it anything. Third, you can share your knowledge to other folks. When you read this The
Plum in the Golden Vase or, Chin P'ing Mei, Volume Three: The Aphrodisiac: 3 (Princeton Library of Asian
Translations), you are able to tells your family, friends and also soon about yours reserve. Your knowledge
can inspire average, make them reading a book.

Mary Brunner:

A lot of people always spent their very own free time to vacation as well as go to the outside with them
family members or their friend. Do you know? Many a lot of people spent many people free time just
watching TV, as well as playing video games all day long. If you need to try to find a new activity that's look
different you can read a book. It is really fun to suit your needs. If you enjoy the book that you just read you
can spent all day every day to reading a guide. The book The Plum in the Golden Vase or, Chin P'ing Mei,



Volume Three: The Aphrodisiac: 3 (Princeton Library of Asian Translations) it doesn't matter what good to
read. There are a lot of those who recommended this book. These were enjoying reading this book. In case
you did not have enough space to deliver this book you can buy the actual e-book. You can m0ore simply to
read this book from a smart phone. The price is not too expensive but this book has high quality.
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