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Love, sex, and relationship wisdom from the polyamory movement are offered in this practical guide to
spiritual enlightenment. Contrary to popular belief, monogamy and celibacy are not the only two options for
exploring a spiritual path. In Opening Love, Dr. Anya translates the lessons learned by the pioneers of the
polyamory (many loves) movement for readers who actively pursue personal growth through spiritual
practice. Drawing on both personal experience and philosophical reflection, this nonfiction guide explains
how to cultivate intentional, creative, non-conventional relationships that center on principles of honesty and
consent. Instead of committing solely to a single person, spiritual seekers can instead commit to pursuing
openness and courage in all their interactions. As polyamorists understand: love, sex, and relationships are
not scarce commodities, rather they are an abundant resource for healing and evolving one's consciousness.
With eloquence and precision, Dr. Anya describes how to cultivate compersion (the opposite of jealousy),
find an intentional community based on common core values, and build advanced emotional and
communication skills. Meditation and reflection practices are offered throughout, to create an interactive,
truly transformative learning experience.
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From reader reviews:

Micheal Taylor:

Do you considered one of people who can't read pleasant if the sentence chained within the straightway, hold
on guys that aren't like that. This Opening Love: Intentional Relationships & the Evolution of Consciousness
book is readable through you who hate those perfect word style. You will find the data here are arrange for
enjoyable reading experience without leaving also decrease the knowledge that want to supply to you. The
writer of Opening Love: Intentional Relationships & the Evolution of Consciousness content conveys the
thought easily to understand by many people. The printed and e-book are not different in the content but it
just different as it. So , do you nonetheless thinking Opening Love: Intentional Relationships & the
Evolution of Consciousness is not loveable to be your top list reading book?

Jonathan Gomes:

Why? Because this Opening Love: Intentional Relationships & the Evolution of Consciousness is an
unordinary book that the inside of the publication waiting for you to snap the item but latter it will surprise
you with the secret the idea inside. Reading this book next to it was fantastic author who also write the book
in such incredible way makes the content inside easier to understand, entertaining means but still convey the
meaning entirely. So , it is good for you for not hesitating having this any longer or you going to regret it.
This unique book will give you a lot of gains than the other book get such as help improving your
proficiency and your critical thinking approach. So , still want to hesitate having that book? If I have been
you I will go to the guide store hurriedly.

Kelly Thompson:

Do you have something that you enjoy such as book? The publication lovers usually prefer to pick book like
comic, limited story and the biggest the first is novel. Now, why not hoping Opening Love: Intentional
Relationships & the Evolution of Consciousness that give your fun preference will be satisfied through
reading this book. Reading practice all over the world can be said as the means for people to know world
much better then how they react to the world. It can't be stated constantly that reading habit only for the
geeky particular person but for all of you who wants to always be success person. So , for all you who want
to start studying as your good habit, you may pick Opening Love: Intentional Relationships & the Evolution
of Consciousness become your starter.

Jonathan Baker:

A lot of people said that they feel bored stiff when they reading a publication. They are directly felt the item
when they get a half regions of the book. You can choose the book Opening Love: Intentional Relationships
& the Evolution of Consciousness to make your current reading is interesting. Your own skill of reading
expertise is developing when you similar to reading. Try to choose basic book to make you enjoy to study it
and mingle the sensation about book and examining especially. It is to be first opinion for you to like to wide



open a book and read it. Beside that the book Opening Love: Intentional Relationships & the Evolution of
Consciousness can to be your brand-new friend when you're experience alone and confuse using what must
you're doing of these time.
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