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"Dark, dangerous, edgy, and deliciously sexy!" --Julie Ann Walker, New York Times  bestselling author

"Kate SeRine knows how to pack a punch!" --Donna Grant, New York Times  bestselling author

Luke Rogan's assignment is simple: secure young Elijah Scoffield and his mother and bring them back to
headquarters--just an ordinary mission for an operative of the Dark Alliance. But Elijah is no ordinary kid.
He's the grandson of one of the country's most influential politicians--a man privy to the Alliance's most
valuable secrets, including its centuries-long connection to the Knights Templar. And someone else is
attempting to capture the boy--someone who's proven he doesn't give a damn about collateral damage. . .

Heartbroken at the lies that tore her world apart, Sarah Scoffield will do anything to protect her son--even if
that means teaming up with a deadly stranger. But Sarah soon finds herself falling in love with her dark hero.
And as danger stalks ever closer, the fiery desire that claims them awakens in Sarah passions she'd thought
dead and buried long ago. . .

"One hell of a story." --The Romance Reviews on Grimm Consequences
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From reader reviews:

Margie Turner:

This book untitled Deceived (A Dark Alliance Novel) to be one of several books which best seller in this
year, honestly, that is because when you read this e-book you can get a lot of benefit onto it. You will easily
to buy this particular book in the book retail store or you can order it by using online. The publisher in this
book sells the e-book too. It makes you quicker to read this book, since you can read this book in your
Smartphone. So there is no reason for your requirements to past this book from your list.

Sharon Doyle:

Reading a reserve tends to be new life style in this particular era globalization. With examining you can get a
lot of information that will give you benefit in your life. Together with book everyone in this world could
share their idea. Textbooks can also inspire a lot of people. Lots of author can inspire all their reader with
their story or maybe their experience. Not only the story that share in the publications. But also they write
about the ability about something that you need case in point. How to get the good score toefl, or how to
teach your young ones, there are many kinds of book which exist now. The authors nowadays always try to
improve their ability in writing, they also doing some analysis before they write with their book. One of them
is this Deceived (A Dark Alliance Novel).

Vicki Harris:

Can you one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt when you find yourself in the book store?
Try and pick one book that you never know the inside because don't evaluate book by its handle may doesn't
work is difficult job because you are frightened that the inside maybe not while fantastic as in the outside
appear likes. Maybe you answer might be Deceived (A Dark Alliance Novel) why because the amazing
cover that make you consider with regards to the content will not disappoint anyone. The inside or content is
actually fantastic as the outside or even cover. Your reading 6th sense will directly direct you to pick up this
book.

Robert Shaw:

Don't be worry when you are afraid that this book can filled the space in your house, you could have it in e-
book approach, more simple and reachable. That Deceived (A Dark Alliance Novel) can give you a lot of
friends because by you looking at this one book you have point that they don't and make a person more like
an interesting person. This particular book can be one of one step for you to get success. This guide offer you
information that probably your friend doesn't recognize, by knowing more than some other make you to be
great persons. So , why hesitate? We should have Deceived (A Dark Alliance Novel).



Download and Read Online Deceived (A Dark Alliance Novel) Kate
Serine #XD6LNVBRGW1



Read Deceived (A Dark Alliance Novel) by Kate Serine for online
ebook

Deceived (A Dark Alliance Novel) by Kate Serine Free PDF d0wnl0ad, audio books, books to read, good
books to read, cheap books, good books, online books, books online, book reviews epub, read books online,
books to read online, online library, greatbooks to read, PDF best books to read, top books to read Deceived
(A Dark Alliance Novel) by Kate Serine books to read online.

Online Deceived (A Dark Alliance Novel) by Kate Serine ebook PDF download

Deceived (A Dark Alliance Novel) by Kate Serine Doc

Deceived (A Dark Alliance Novel) by Kate Serine Mobipocket

Deceived (A Dark Alliance Novel) by Kate Serine EPub


