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In their own voices, women show how to strengthen your relationship-with surprising revelations from New
York Times bestselling author Gary Neuman

This breakthrough book, based on the voices of real women from all walks of life and groundbreaking new
research, shows couples how to grow stronger by understanding what women need from a romantic
relationship. In Connect to Love, family counselor and relationships expert M.Gary Neuman explores the
problems that women face in their marriages or relationships that might make them dissatisfied with their
partners-or willing to stray. Neuman reveals the startling discoveries he made through his in-depth new
research of more than five hundred women. When it comes to sexual intimacy, for instance, wives who are
satisfied with their marriages have sex more than twice as frequently than those who are dissatisfied.

Includes a step-by-step two-week plan to improve your relationship●

Filled with dramatic personal stories and surprising findings on sex, emotional issues, intimacy,●

communication, and more
From the author of the New York Times bestseller The Truth about Cheating●

Neuman has been a frequent guest on Oprah, Today, and other major TV shows●

Written for couples while addressing both female and male issues●

Written with a compassionate and down-to-earth tone, Connect to Love will open your eyes to see
relationships in a new way while empowering yourself and your partner for change.
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From reader reviews:

Kevin Burkes:

Hey guys, do you really wants to finds a new book to learn? May be the book with the concept Connect to
Love: The Keys to Transforming Your Relationship suitable to you? The particular book was written by
well-known writer in this era. The book untitled Connect to Love: The Keys to Transforming Your
Relationshipis a single of several books that will everyone read now. That book was inspired lots of people
in the world. When you read this reserve you will enter the new dimension that you ever know previous to.
The author explained their strategy in the simple way, and so all of people can easily to recognise the core of
this book. This book will give you a wide range of information about this world now. To help you see the
represented of the world in this book.

Arturo McDaniel:

The e-book with title Connect to Love: The Keys to Transforming Your Relationship contains a lot of
information that you can discover it. You can get a lot of advantage after read this book. This kind of book
exist new expertise the information that exist in this reserve represented the condition of the world at this
point. That is important to yo7u to understand how the improvement of the world. This particular book will
bring you with new era of the syndication. You can read the e-book with your smart phone, so you can read
it anywhere you want.

Jeffery Hall:

Beside this particular Connect to Love: The Keys to Transforming Your Relationship in your phone, it may
give you a way to get closer to the new knowledge or details. The information and the knowledge you might
got here is fresh from your oven so don't possibly be worry if you feel like an old people live in narrow
commune. It is good thing to have Connect to Love: The Keys to Transforming Your Relationship because
this book offers to your account readable information. Do you at times have book but you seldom get what
it's facts concerning. Oh come on, that will not happen if you have this inside your hand. The Enjoyable
agreement here cannot be questionable, similar to treasuring beautiful island. Techniques you still want to
miss the idea? Find this book and also read it from right now!

Eddie Grabowski:

As a university student exactly feel bored for you to reading. If their teacher questioned them to go to the
library as well as to make summary for some publication, they are complained. Just minor students that has
reading's internal or real their interest. They just do what the professor want, like asked to go to the library.
They go to generally there but nothing reading critically. Any students feel that reading is not important,
boring along with can't see colorful photographs on there. Yeah, it is to be complicated. Book is very
important for you. As we know that on this period of time, many ways to get whatever we want. Likewise
word says, ways to reach Chinese's country. So , this Connect to Love: The Keys to Transforming Your



Relationship can make you feel more interested to read.
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