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From the celebrated imagination of Dean Koontz comes a powerful reworking of one of the classic stories of
all time. If you think you know the legend, you know only half the truth. Here is the mystery, the myth, the
terror, and the magic of…

Dean Koontz's City of the Night

They are stronger, heal better, and think faster than any humans ever created—and they must be destroyed.
But not even Victor Helios—once Frankenstein—can stop the engineered killers he’s set loose on a reign of
terror through modern-day New Orleans. Now the only hope rests in a one-time “monster” and his all-too-
human partners, Detectives Carson O’Connor and Michael Maddison. Deucalion’ s centuries-old history
began as Victor’s first and failed attempt to build the perfect human–and it is fated to end in the ultimate
confrontation between a damned creature and his mad creator. But first Deucalion must destroy a
monstrosity not even Victor’ s malignant mind could have imagined—an indestructible entity that steps out
of humankind’ s collective nightmare with one purpose: to replace us.

BONUS: This edition contains an excerpt from Dean Koontz's The City.
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From reader reviews:

Enrique McLean:

Information is provisions for anyone to get better life, information today can get by anyone with everywhere.
The information can be a know-how or any news even restricted. What people must be consider if those
information which is inside the former life are difficult to be find than now's taking seriously which one is
acceptable to believe or which one typically the resource are convinced. If you obtain the unstable resource
then you buy it as your main information it will have huge disadvantage for you. All of those possibilities
will not happen within you if you take Frankenstein: City of Night: A Novel as the daily resource
information.

Edward Schanz:

The guide untitled Frankenstein: City of Night: A Novel is the publication that recommended to you to learn.
You can see the quality of the reserve content that will be shown to a person. The language that article author
use to explained their ideas are easily to understand. The copy writer was did a lot of exploration when write
the book, hence the information that they share for your requirements is absolutely accurate. You also will
get the e-book of Frankenstein: City of Night: A Novel from the publisher to make you a lot more enjoy free
time.

Rita Kirby:

Do you like reading a guide? Confuse to looking for your favorite book? Or your book was rare? Why so
many query for the book? But any people feel that they enjoy intended for reading. Some people likes
studying, not only science book but also novel and Frankenstein: City of Night: A Novel or others sources
were given know-how for you. After you know how the good a book, you feel wish to read more and more.
Science guide was created for teacher or perhaps students especially. Those textbooks are helping them to
bring their knowledge. In different case, beside science guide, any other book likes Frankenstein: City of
Night: A Novel to make your spare time much more colorful. Many types of book like this.

Gary Lewis:

A lot of book has printed but it is unique. You can get it by internet on social media. You can choose the
very best book for you, science, amusing, novel, or whatever by means of searching from it. It is called of
book Frankenstein: City of Night: A Novel. You'll be able to your knowledge by it. Without departing the
printed book, it can add your knowledge and make you happier to read. It is most critical that, you must
aware about publication. It can bring you from one location to other place.
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