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I was naked, handcuffed, and blindfolded.

All around me, the voices of my captors shouted continuously in my ear – a stream of Arabic I couldn’t
understand. It became an endless mantra as I struggled to work out what had gone wrong – what had
happened that landed me up in this horrible situation.

I could feel warm blood running down the back of my head, mixing with the sweat and dust that already
caked my body. My head throbbed from the repeated pistol barrel and rifle butt jabs. It felt like the onset of a
migraine, that kind of numbing pain that lets you know the fun’s about to really start. Things took the express
lift from bad to absolutely horrendous…there seemed a real finality in the tone of what they said. My
stomach sank…

Colin Maclachlan is instantly recognisable as the granite faced Scot who formed part of the elite ex special
forces team in the hit Channel 4 TV series SAS: Who Dares Wins.

During his 22 years in the armed services, he faced danger and death on many occasions and The Pilgrim is
his action-packed autobiography. Growing up with an abusive parent, he was forced to sign up for the army
at the age of 15. After 10 years in the Royal Scots, he was the first in his regiment in 20 years to pass the
selection process for the SAS. Over the next 12 years he established a reputation as one of the most talented
members of the elite special force. He worked alongside MI5, MI6, 14 Int, GCHQ, SBS, CIA, Delta Force
and Seal Team 6 – one of the few to have contact with all these departments.

As a trained hostage negotiator and rescuer, he was part of the notorious Operation Certain Death in Sierra
Leone and was the first sniper on the scene of a hijacked flight at Stansted. He was then on the other side of a
rescue mission when he was taken hostage in Basra in 2006 and brutally beaten before being rescued by
British troops.

The Pilgrim is more than just a Boy’s Own story. It is a heartfelt exploration of what it means to be a modern
soldier, to work in the SAS, to have a gun held to your head, to see your friends die beside you – all in the
line of duty.
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From reader reviews:

Robert Frye:

Here thing why this kind of The Pilgrim: Soldier. Hostage. Survivor. are different and reputable to be yours.
First of all examining a book is good nevertheless it depends in the content than it which is the content is as
delightful as food or not. The Pilgrim: Soldier. Hostage. Survivor. giving you information deeper and
different ways, you can find any guide out there but there is no guide that similar with The Pilgrim: Soldier.
Hostage. Survivor.. It gives you thrill reading journey, its open up your eyes about the thing in which
happened in the world which is maybe can be happened around you. It is easy to bring everywhere like in
area, café, or even in your approach home by train. When you are having difficulties in bringing the paper
book maybe the form of The Pilgrim: Soldier. Hostage. Survivor. in e-book can be your choice.

Dolores Wade:

People live in this new time of lifestyle always try and and must have the time or they will get lot of stress
from both lifestyle and work. So , once we ask do people have free time, we will say absolutely of course.
People is human not a robot. Then we request again, what kind of activity do you possess when the spare
time coming to you actually of course your answer will certainly unlimited right. Then ever try this one,
reading ebooks. It can be your alternative in spending your spare time, typically the book you have read is
definitely The Pilgrim: Soldier. Hostage. Survivor..

Edna Miller:

In this era globalization it is important to someone to find information. The information will make anyone to
understand the condition of the world. The health of the world makes the information better to share. You
can find a lot of recommendations to get information example: internet, classifieds, book, and soon. You will
observe that now, a lot of publisher this print many kinds of book. The particular book that recommended to
you is The Pilgrim: Soldier. Hostage. Survivor. this book consist a lot of the information in the condition of
this world now. This kind of book was represented so why is the world has grown up. The terminology styles
that writer use to explain it is easy to understand. The particular writer made some study when he makes this
book. That is why this book suited all of you.

Billy Golden:

E-book is one of source of expertise. We can add our understanding from it. Not only for students but in
addition native or citizen require book to know the change information of year to help year. As we know
those guides have many advantages. Beside many of us add our knowledge, may also bring us to around the
world. With the book The Pilgrim: Soldier. Hostage. Survivor. we can get more advantage. Don't someone to
be creative people? For being creative person must like to read a book. Simply choose the best book that
appropriate with your aim. Don't be doubt to change your life at this time book The Pilgrim: Soldier.
Hostage. Survivor.. You can more pleasing than now.
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