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What principles enabled the concerned mom of two junior high school students to move from deciding she
needed to pray for her kids at school to becoming the founder of a worldwide prayer movement called Moms
In Touch International? Fern Nichols is a passionate believer in the power of prayer. She knows that a
regular habit of prayer can change things--can bring home wayward children, heal broken marriages, and
provide answers to desperate situations. Prayer can also bring a new kind of peace and contentment no
matter what hardships or disappointments we face. But most important, Fern knows that through prayer we
can experience, firsthand, an ever-increasing intimacy with God.

In Every Child Needs a Praying Mom, Fern Nichols now shares how she has taught women to pray in a way
that changes their lives and the lives of those they love. She teaches the principles and practices that will not
only revolutionize the way people think about prayer, but the way they do pray, leading them into a deeper
intimacy with Jesus, who is always interceding on our behalf.

Sparkling with real life stories of God at work in the lives of praying moms, Fern introduces us to the four
prayers that are the foundation of the Moms In Touch approach to prayer: Praise--Praying according to the
attributes of God; Confession--Breaking strongholds; Thanksgiving--Expressing a grateful heart;
Intercession--Standing in the gap with Jesus. What transforms these well-known elements of prayer into such
a powerful force in Moms In Touch International? Fern Nichols introduces a way of praying that energizes,
creates an appetite for intimacy with God, overcomes spiritual paralysis, eliminates fear, unveils the heart
and character of God and transforms the pray-er’s life and perspective. She teaches how to pray effectively
with others, how to prepare for the spiritual battles that swirl when prayer is on the move, how to persist in
prayer in the face of hopelessness and despair, and how to use Scripture for effective prayer. Changing Your
World through Prayer will do just that. God hears. God acts. God moves. God works.
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From reader reviews:

Thelma Price:

This Every Child Needs a Praying Mom usually are reliable for you who want to be considered a successful
person, why. The main reason of this Every Child Needs a Praying Mom can be one of many great books
you must have is usually giving you more than just simple reading through food but feed a person with
information that maybe will shock your before knowledge. This book is handy, you can bring it everywhere
you go and whenever your conditions at e-book and printed versions. Beside that this Every Child Needs a
Praying Mom giving you an enormous of experience for instance rich vocabulary, giving you trial of critical
thinking that we realize it useful in your day pastime. So , let's have it and revel in reading.

Bertha Greene:

People live in this new morning of lifestyle always make an effort to and must have the extra time or they
will get large amount of stress from both everyday life and work. So , once we ask do people have extra
time, we will say absolutely yes. People is human not really a huge robot. Then we question again, what kind
of activity are there when the spare time coming to you of course your answer will probably unlimited right.
Then do you try this one, reading books. It can be your alternative in spending your spare time, often the
book you have read is actually Every Child Needs a Praying Mom.

Craig Palmer:

Can you one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt if you find yourself in the book store? Try
and pick one book that you just dont know the inside because don't ascertain book by its include may doesn't
work this is difficult job because you are frightened that the inside maybe not while fantastic as in the outside
look likes. Maybe you answer might be Every Child Needs a Praying Mom why because the excellent cover
that make you consider about the content will not disappoint you actually. The inside or content will be
fantastic as the outside or even cover. Your reading sixth sense will directly guide you to pick up this book.

Marc Dean:

As we know that book is important thing to add our knowledge for everything. By a publication we can
know everything you want. A book is a set of written, printed, illustrated or perhaps blank sheet. Every year
ended up being exactly added. This guide Every Child Needs a Praying Mom was filled in relation to
science. Spend your free time to add your knowledge about your science competence. Some people has
several feel when they reading some sort of book. If you know how big benefit of a book, you can sense
enjoy to read a reserve. In the modern era like currently, many ways to get book which you wanted.
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