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The occurrence in some criminal cases of "cultural defenses" on behalf of "minority" defendants has stirred
much debate. This book is the first to illuminate how "cultural evidence" — i.e., "evidence" regarding
ethnicity — is actually negotiated by attorneys, expert/lay witnesses, and defendants in criminal trials.
Caroline Braunmühl demonstrates that this has occurred, overwhelmingly, in ways shaped by colonialist and
patriarchal discourses common in the Western world. She argues that the controversy regarding the
legitimacy of a "cultural defense" has tended to obscure this fact, and has been biased against minorities as
well as all women from its inception, in the very terms in which the question for debate has been framed.

This study also breaks new ground by analyzing the strategies, and the failures, in which colonialist and
patriarchal constructions of cultural evidence are resisted or — more commonly — colluded in by opposing
attorneys, witnesses, and defendants themselves. The constructions at hand emerge as contradictory and
unstable, belying the notion that cultural evidence is a matter of objective "information" about another
culture, rather than — as Braunmühl argues — of discourses that are inevitably normatively charged.

Colonial Discourse and Gender in US Criminal Courts moves the debate about cultural defenses onto an
entirely new plane, one based upon the understanding that only in-depth empirical analyses informed by
critical, rigorous theoretical reflection can do justice to the irreducibly political character of any discussion of
"cultural evidence," and of its presentation in court.
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From reader reviews:

Brian Dunlap:

Inside other case, little people like to read book Colonial Discourse and Gender in U.S. Criminal Courts:
Cultural Defenses and Prosecutions (Routledge Advances in Criminology). You can choose the best book if
you like reading a book. So long as we know about how is important the book Colonial Discourse and
Gender in U.S. Criminal Courts: Cultural Defenses and Prosecutions (Routledge Advances in Criminology).
You can add know-how and of course you can around the world by just a book. Absolutely right, because
from book you can recognize everything! From your country right up until foreign or abroad you may be
known. About simple issue until wonderful thing you could know that. In this era, we are able to open a book
or searching by internet product. It is called e-book. You can utilize it when you feel weary to go to the
library. Let's read.

Cheryl Grosvenor:

What do you think about book? It is just for students since they are still students or that for all people in the
world, the particular best subject for that? Merely you can be answered for that query above. Every person
has diverse personality and hobby for every other. Don't to be forced someone or something that they don't
want do that. You must know how great in addition to important the book Colonial Discourse and Gender in
U.S. Criminal Courts: Cultural Defenses and Prosecutions (Routledge Advances in Criminology). All type of
book are you able to see on many options. You can look for the internet methods or other social media.

Juan Crowe:

Many people spending their time by playing outside having friends, fun activity together with family or just
watching TV the whole day. You can have new activity to invest your whole day by reading a book. Ugh, ya
think reading a book really can hard because you have to bring the book everywhere? It ok you can have the
e-book, bringing everywhere you want in your Smart phone. Like Colonial Discourse and Gender in U.S.
Criminal Courts: Cultural Defenses and Prosecutions (Routledge Advances in Criminology) which is getting
the e-book version. So , why not try out this book? Let's find.

Jennifer Lewis:

A lot of publication has printed but it is unique. You can get it by world wide web on social media. You can
choose the top book for you, science, witty, novel, or whatever through searching from it. It is called of book
Colonial Discourse and Gender in U.S. Criminal Courts: Cultural Defenses and Prosecutions (Routledge
Advances in Criminology). Contain your knowledge by it. Without leaving behind the printed book, it could
add your knowledge and make anyone happier to read. It is most important that, you must aware about book.
It can bring you from one destination to other place.
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