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This Very Short Introduction offers a powerfully-written explanation of the war's complex origins and
course, and explores its impact on a personal and international scale. It also provides an ethical reflection on
the war in the context of Europe's tumultuous twentieth century, highlighting why it has inspired some of the
greatest writers of our time, and how it continues to resonate today in Britain, continental Europe, and
beyond.

Throughout the book, the focus is on the war as an arena of social change where ideas about culture were
forged or resisted, and in which both Spaniards and non-Spaniards participated alike. These were conflicts
that during the Second World War would stretch from Franco's regime, which envisaged itself as part of the
Nazi new order, to Europe and beyond. Accordingly, this book examines Spanish participation in European
resistance movements during World War II and also the ongoing civil war
waged politically, economically, judicially and culturally inside Spain by Francoism after its military victory
in 1939. History writing itself became a battleground and the book charts the Franco regime's attempt to
appropriate the past. It also indicates its ultimate failure - as evident in new
writings on the war and, above all, in the return of Republican memory now occurring in Spain during the
opening years of the twenty-first century.

ABOUT THE SERIES: The Very Short Introductions series from Oxford University Press contains hundreds
of titles in almost every subject area. These pocket-sized books are the perfect way to get ahead in a new
subject quickly. Our expert authors combine facts, analysis, perspective, new ideas, and enthusiasm to make
interesting and challenging topics highly readable.
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From reader reviews:

Amelia Gallup:

The book The Spanish Civil War: A Very Short Introduction (Very Short Introductions) give you a sense of
feeling enjoy for your spare time. You can use to make your capable considerably more increase. Book can
to become your best friend when you getting strain or having big problem using your subject. If you can
make looking at a book The Spanish Civil War: A Very Short Introduction (Very Short Introductions) to get
your habit, you can get far more advantages, like add your own personal capable, increase your knowledge
about a few or all subjects. You may know everything if you like wide open and read a guide The Spanish
Civil War: A Very Short Introduction (Very Short Introductions). Kinds of book are several. It means that,
science publication or encyclopedia or other people. So , how do you think about this guide?

Patricia Ables:

Information is provisions for individuals to get better life, information nowadays can get by anyone in
everywhere. The information can be a understanding or any news even a concern. What people must be
consider any time those information which is inside former life are challenging to be find than now's taking
seriously which one is suitable to believe or which one typically the resource are convinced. If you receive
the unstable resource then you get it as your main information there will be huge disadvantage for you. All of
those possibilities will not happen throughout you if you take The Spanish Civil War: A Very Short
Introduction (Very Short Introductions) as your daily resource information.

Michael Lockwood:

The book untitled The Spanish Civil War: A Very Short Introduction (Very Short Introductions) contain a lot
of information on this. The writer explains her idea with easy method. The language is very clear to see all
the people, so do certainly not worry, you can easy to read that. The book was written by famous author. The
author gives you in the new age of literary works. You can actually read this book because you can keep
reading your smart phone, or program, so you can read the book inside anywhere and anytime. If you want to
buy the e-book, you can wide open their official web-site in addition to order it. Have a nice learn.

Helen Massey:

Don't be worry for anyone who is afraid that this book will filled the space in your house, you will get it in e-
book method, more simple and reachable. This particular The Spanish Civil War: A Very Short Introduction
(Very Short Introductions) can give you a lot of close friends because by you looking at this one book you
have matter that they don't and make a person more like an interesting person. That book can be one of one
step for you to get success. This e-book offer you information that possibly your friend doesn't realize, by
knowing more than other make you to be great folks. So , why hesitate? We need to have The Spanish Civil
War: A Very Short Introduction (Very Short Introductions).
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