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This wide-ranging cultural and political history rewrites the 1970s as the crucial, pivotal era of our time.
Jefferson Cowie’s edgy and incisive book—part political intrigue, part labor history, with large doses of
American musical, film, and TV lore—makes new sense of the 1970s as a crucial and poorly understood
transition from New Deal America (with its large, optimistic middle class) to the widening economic
inequalities, poverty, and dampened expectations of the 1980s and into the present. 

Stayin’ Alive takes us from the factory floors of Ohio, Pittsburgh, and Detroit, to the Washington of Nixon,
Ford, and Carter. Cowie also connects politics to culture, showing how the big screen and the jukebox can
help us understand how America turned away from the radicalism of the 1960s and toward the patriotic
promise of Ronald Reagan. Cowie makes unexpected connections between the secrets of the Nixon White
House and the failings of George McGovern campaign; radicalism and the blue-collar backlash; the earthy
twang of Merle Haggard’s country music and the falsetto highs of Saturday Night Fever. Like Jeff
Perlstein’s acclaimed Nixonland, Stayin’ Alive moves beyond conventional understandings of the period and
brilliantly plumbs it for insights into our current way of life.
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From reader reviews:

Gayle Skinner:

Reading a book tends to be new life style on this era globalization. With looking at you can get a lot of
information that will give you benefit in your life. Having book everyone in this world can share their idea.
Textbooks can also inspire a lot of people. A lot of author can inspire their particular reader with their story
or maybe their experience. Not only the story that share in the guides. But also they write about the
information about something that you need instance. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach
children, there are many kinds of book which exist now. The authors on this planet always try to improve
their skill in writing, they also doing some study before they write with their book. One of them is this
Stayin' Alive: The 1970s and the Last Days of the Working Class.

Robert Reynolds:

The book untitled Stayin' Alive: The 1970s and the Last Days of the Working Class contain a lot of
information on it. The writer explains the woman idea with easy way. The language is very simple to
implement all the people, so do definitely not worry, you can easy to read the idea. The book was compiled
by famous author. The author gives you in the new period of literary works. You can actually read this book
because you can continue reading your smart phone, or product, so you can read the book in anywhere and
anytime. If you want to buy the e-book, you can available their official web-site along with order it. Have a
nice study.

Marilyn McDermott:

Many people spending their moment by playing outside using friends, fun activity with family or just
watching TV the entire day. You can have new activity to enjoy your whole day by examining a book. Ugh,
you think reading a book can definitely hard because you have to accept the book everywhere? It all right
you can have the e-book, taking everywhere you want in your Touch screen phone. Like Stayin' Alive: The
1970s and the Last Days of the Working Class which is obtaining the e-book version. So , try out this book?
Let's observe.

Robert Jones:

Reading a book make you to get more knowledge from this. You can take knowledge and information from
the book. Book is published or printed or illustrated from each source that filled update of news. With this
modern era like at this point, many ways to get information are available for anyone. From media social such
as newspaper, magazines, science e-book, encyclopedia, reference book, fresh and comic. You can add your
understanding by that book. Isn't it time to spend your spare time to open your book? Or just trying to find
the Stayin' Alive: The 1970s and the Last Days of the Working Class when you necessary it?
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