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Yes, you can have children after cancer.
 
When faced with a cancer diagnosis, many doctors and patients rush full-speed ahead into treatment, giving
minimal attention to the potential fertility implications. Luckily, the field of oncofertility is growing quickly,
and medical writer Gina Shaw, herself a cancer survivor, is ready to unravel the complex and evolving issues
involved in pre- and post-cancer fertility and family-building options—for both men and women. Having
Children After Cancer gives you all the tools you need to:

Understand how different cancers can affect fertility●

Identify which treatments?chemo, radiation, and surgery?can potentially impair your fertility●

Discuss fertility-sparing treatment options with your doctor●

Select the fertility preservation method that’s right for you—from freezing eggs, embryos, and sperm to●

preserving ovarian tissue
Analyze the chances of getting pregnant—using natural methods and with in vitro fertilization●

Determinethe best time to get pregnant (and which drug therapies to avoid while doing so)●

Have a healthy post-cancer pregnancy●

Navigate surrogacy and what to tell prospective candidates about your medical history●

Consider adoption and learn about survivor-friendly adoption programs and countries●

Find sample medical letters and other insurance-company red-tape busting information●

Think through the implications of mother- and fatherhood after cancer●

Figure out how to talk to your children about the big C●

With a foreword by top oncologist Hope Rugo of the UCSF Cancer Center, this first and only cancer-and-
fertility guide for patients and survivors will allow you to be your own best advocate throughout the journey.

From the Trade Paperback edition.
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From reader reviews:

Richard Reid:

In this 21st century, people become competitive in every way. By being competitive right now, people have
do something to make these individuals survives, being in the middle of often the crowded place and notice
by means of surrounding. One thing that often many people have underestimated it for a while is reading.
That's why, by reading a reserve your ability to survive boost then having chance to endure than other is
high. To suit your needs who want to start reading a new book, we give you this kind of Having Children
After Cancer: How to Make Informed Choices Before and After Treatment and Build the Family of Your
Dreams book as basic and daily reading book. Why, because this book is usually more than just a book.

Mitchell Diaz:

Do you one among people who can't read enjoyable if the sentence chained within the straightway, hold on
guys this aren't like that. This Having Children After Cancer: How to Make Informed Choices Before and
After Treatment and Build the Family of Your Dreams book is readable by means of you who hate the
perfect word style. You will find the details here are arrange for enjoyable studying experience without
leaving actually decrease the knowledge that want to supply to you. The writer connected with Having
Children After Cancer: How to Make Informed Choices Before and After Treatment and Build the Family of
Your Dreams content conveys the thought easily to understand by many individuals. The printed and e-book
are not different in the articles but it just different available as it. So , do you nevertheless thinking Having
Children After Cancer: How to Make Informed Choices Before and After Treatment and Build the Family of
Your Dreams is not loveable to be your top checklist reading book?

George Degregorio:

Nowadays reading books be a little more than want or need but also be a life style. This reading practice give
you lot of advantages. The advantages you got of course the knowledge the particular information inside the
book in which improve your knowledge and information. The knowledge you get based on what kind of
book you read, if you want send more knowledge just go with education and learning books but if you want
experience happy read one together with theme for entertaining such as comic or novel. The Having Children
After Cancer: How to Make Informed Choices Before and After Treatment and Build the Family of Your
Dreams is kind of guide which is giving the reader unpredictable experience.

Christine Knox:

Is it a person who having spare time in that case spend it whole day simply by watching television programs
or just lying on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This Having Children After Cancer: How to
Make Informed Choices Before and After Treatment and Build the Family of Your Dreams can be the
respond to, oh how comes? The new book you know. You are consequently out of date, spending your extra
time by reading in this completely new era is common not a nerd activity. So what these publications have



than the others?
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