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It’s easier to follow rules if you make them yourself. This collection of kid-authored, kid-approved
guidelines for living makes a great gift for the child inside of everyone.

Ten-year-old Isabelle and her eight-year-old cousin Isabella have a few tips for living life. Well, maybe more
than a few. Begun as a guide for Isabelle’s younger sister, the girls’ list quickly grew, and soon more than
150 rules filled a secret notebook.

Some rules are simple: “Recycle.” “Eat whatever your mom makes for dinner and don’t complain.” Others
are practical: “Go to sleep early if you have soccer practice in the morning.” Others are sweet: “Protect each
other.” And others are downright hilarious: “Color on paper, not on people.” “Don’t bite the dentist.”

When Isabelle and Isabella lost their handwritten list of rules in a store, they feared it was gone forever. But
after a clerk found their notebook and posted about it on Facebook, Isabelle and Isabella became overnight
sensations—the staff of Good Morning America said, “Everyone here wants a copy of this. This is going to
be a bestseller!” Because after all, who doesn’t need a little help navigating their way through life, at any
age?
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From reader reviews:

Angel Gardner:

Inside other case, little people like to read book Isabelle & Isabella's Little Book of Rules. You can choose
the best book if you like reading a book. So long as we know about how is important a new book Isabelle &
Isabella's Little Book of Rules. You can add information and of course you can around the world by a book.
Absolutely right, simply because from book you can recognize everything! From your country till foreign or
abroad you will find yourself known. About simple point until wonderful thing you could know that. In this
era, you can open a book or searching by internet product. It is called e-book. You may use it when you feel
bored stiff to go to the library. Let's go through.

Russell Stringer:

The reserve with title Isabelle & Isabella's Little Book of Rules posesses a lot of information that you can
find out it. You can get a lot of gain after read this book. This specific book exist new information the
information that exist in this book represented the condition of the world at this point. That is important to
yo7u to understand how the improvement of the world. This specific book will bring you within new era of
the globalization. You can read the e-book on your smart phone, so you can read the item anywhere you
want.

John Merritt:

E-book is one of source of information. We can add our information from it. Not only for students but
additionally native or citizen will need book to know the revise information of year in order to year. As we
know those publications have many advantages. Beside we add our knowledge, may also bring us to around
the world. By the book Isabelle & Isabella's Little Book of Rules we can have more advantage. Don't that
you be creative people? To get creative person must prefer to read a book. Just simply choose the best book
that acceptable with your aim. Don't be doubt to change your life at this time book Isabelle & Isabella's Little
Book of Rules. You can more pleasing than now.

Jared Carter:

Reading a book make you to get more knowledge as a result. You can take knowledge and information from
your book. Book is written or printed or descriptive from each source this filled update of news. On this
modern era like now, many ways to get information are available for you. From media social like newspaper,
magazines, science e-book, encyclopedia, reference book, fresh and comic. You can add your understanding
by that book. Are you ready to spend your spare time to spread out your book? Or just trying to find the
Isabelle & Isabella's Little Book of Rules when you essential it?
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