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War Culture and the Contest of Images analyzes the relationships among contemporary war, documentary

practices, and democratic ideals. Dora Apel examines a wide variety of images and cultural representations

of war in the United States and the Middle East, including photography, performance art, video games,

reenactment, and social media images. Simultaneously, she explores the merging of photojournalism and

artistic practices, the effects of visual framing, and the construction of both sanctioned and counter-

hegemonic narratives in a global contest of images.

As a result of the global visual culture in which anyone may produce as well as consume public imagery, the

wide variety of visual and documentary practices present realities that would otherwise be invisible or

officially off-limits. In our digital era, the prohibition and control of images has become nearly impossible to

maintain. Using carefully chosen case studies—such as Krzysztof Wodiczko’s video projections and public

works in response to 9/11 and the wars in Iraq and Afghanistan, the performance works of Coco Fusco and

Regina Galindo, and the practices of Israeli and Palestinian artists—Apel posits that contemporary war

images serve as mediating agents in social relations and as a source of protection or refuge for those robbed

of formal or state-sanctioned citizenship.

While never suggesting that documentary practices are objective translations of reality, Apel shows that they

are powerful polemical tools both for legitimizing war and for making its devastating effects visible. In

modern warfare and in the accompanying culture of war that capitalism produces as a permanent feature of

modern society, she asserts that the contest of images is as critical as the war on the ground.
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From reader reviews:

Deborah Beaudry:

Spent a free time to be fun activity to do! A lot of people spent their sparetime with their family, or their
friends. Usually they doing activity like watching television, likely to beach, or picnic from the park. They
actually doing same thing every week. Do you feel it? Will you something different to fill your own free
time/ holiday? Could be reading a book might be option to fill your no cost time/ holiday. The first thing you
will ask may be what kinds of publication that you should read. If you want to test look for book, may be the
e-book untitled War Culture and the Contest of Images (New Directions in International Studies) can be
good book to read. May be it could be best activity to you.

Jennifer Mendoza:

Beside this particular War Culture and the Contest of Images (New Directions in International Studies) in
your phone, it may give you a way to get nearer to the new knowledge or info. The information and the
knowledge you might got here is fresh through the oven so don't end up being worry if you feel like an older
people live in narrow small town. It is good thing to have War Culture and the Contest of Images (New
Directions in International Studies) because this book offers for you readable information. Do you
occasionally have book but you don't get what it's all about. Oh come on, that would not happen if you have
this inside your hand. The Enjoyable arrangement here cannot be questionable, similar to treasuring beautiful
island. Techniques you still want to miss this? Find this book in addition to read it from now!

Michael Due:

Don't be worry should you be afraid that this book may filled the space in your house, you may have it in e-
book way, more simple and reachable. This particular War Culture and the Contest of Images (New
Directions in International Studies) can give you a lot of buddies because by you investigating this one book
you have factor that they don't and make you more like an interesting person. This particular book can be one
of one step for you to get success. This guide offer you information that probably your friend doesn't learn,
by knowing more than additional make you to be great men and women. So , why hesitate? Let me have War
Culture and the Contest of Images (New Directions in International Studies).

Janet Warren:

Reading a reserve make you to get more knowledge from that. You can take knowledge and information
coming from a book. Book is prepared or printed or outlined from each source in which filled update of
news. In this particular modern era like today, many ways to get information are available for anyone. From
media social including newspaper, magazines, science e-book, encyclopedia, reference book, story and
comic. You can add your knowledge by that book. Isn't it time to spend your spare time to spread out your
book? Or just seeking the War Culture and the Contest of Images (New Directions in International Studies)
when you required it?
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