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Best-selling horror novelist Clive Barker had a rocky start with the first attempts to convert his stories into a
visual medium. Directors and screenwriters turned the film adaptations of Underworld and Rawhead Rex
into something barely recognizable--and box office failures as well. Consequently, when he approached film
companies about Hellraiser, Barker insisted that he be involved in every step, including the direction. The
resulting 1987 film has become an undisputed horror classic, spawning a movie franchise that to date
includes eight films. This volume explores not only the cinematic interpretations of the Hellraiser mythos but
also its intrusion into other artistic and cultural forms. Beginning with the unconventional sources of Clive
Barker's inspiration, the book follows Barker from his pre-Hellraiser cinematic experience through the
filming of the horror classic. It examines various themes (such as the undermining of the traditional family
unit and the malleability of the flesh) found throughout the film series and the ways in which the
representation of these themes changes from film to film. The religious aspects of the films are also
discussed. Characters central to the franchise--and the mythos--are examined in detail. Included is a
foreword by actor Doug Bradley, who portrayed the infamous Pinhead.
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From reader reviews:

Fred Miller:

The reason why? Because this The Hellraiser Films and Their Legacy is an unordinary book that the inside
of the reserve waiting for you to snap it but latter it will distress you with the secret it inside. Reading this
book beside it was fantastic author who have write the book in such wonderful way makes the content
interior easier to understand, entertaining approach but still convey the meaning totally. So , it is good for
you for not hesitating having this any longer or you going to regret it. This book will give you a lot of
advantages than the other book have got such as help improving your proficiency and your critical thinking
technique. So , still want to hold up having that book? If I ended up you I will go to the e-book store
hurriedly.

Ann Clark:

It is possible to spend your free time to read this book this reserve. This The Hellraiser Films and Their
Legacy is simple to deliver you can read it in the park, in the beach, train as well as soon. If you did not
include much space to bring typically the printed book, you can buy the e-book. It is make you quicker to
read it. You can save typically the book in your smart phone. So there are a lot of benefits that you will get
when one buys this book.

Phillip Vargas:

Is it you actually who having spare time and then spend it whole day by means of watching television
programs or just lying on the bed? Do you need something new? This The Hellraiser Films and Their Legacy
can be the answer, oh how comes? It's a book you know. You are and so out of date, spending your time by
reading in this fresh era is common not a nerd activity. So what these guides have than the others?

William Henderson:

As a pupil exactly feel bored to help reading. If their teacher asked them to go to the library or even make
summary for some reserve, they are complained. Just little students that has reading's spirit or real their
passion. They just do what the professor want, like asked to the library. They go to right now there but
nothing reading seriously. Any students feel that studying is not important, boring and can't see colorful
photos on there. Yeah, it is for being complicated. Book is very important for yourself. As we know that on
this period of time, many ways to get whatever we really wish for. Likewise word says, many ways to reach
Chinese's country. Therefore , this The Hellraiser Films and Their Legacy can make you truly feel more
interested to read.
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