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Restoring Ecological Health to Your Land is the first practical guidebook to give restorationists and would-
be restorationists with little or no scientific training or background the “how to” information and knowledge
they need to plan and implement ecological restoration activities. The book sets forth a step-by-step process
for developing, implementing, monitoring, and refining on-the-ground restoration projects that is applicable
to a wide range of landscapes and ecosystems.

The first part of the book introduces the process of ecological restoration in simple, easily understood
language through specific examples drawn from the authors’ experience restoring their own lands in
southern and central Wisconsin. It offers systematic, step-by-step strategies along with inspiration and
benchmark experiences. The book’s second half shows how that same “thinking” and “doing” can be applied
to North America’s major ecosystems and landscapes in any condition or scale.

No other ecological restoration book leads by example and first-hand experience likethis one. The authors
encourage readers to champion restoration of ecosystems close to where they live . . . at home, on farms and
ranches, in parks and preserves. It provides an essential bridge for people from all walks of life and all levels
of experience—from land trust member property stewards to agency personnel responsible for restoring
lands in their care—and represents a unique and important contribution to the literature on restoration.
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From reader reviews:

Virgina Scheffer:

In this 21st hundred years, people become competitive in each and every way. By being competitive at this
point, people have do something to make all of them survives, being in the middle of typically the crowded
place and notice by means of surrounding. One thing that at times many people have underestimated the idea
for a while is reading. Yes, by reading a reserve your ability to survive boost then having chance to endure
than other is high. For you personally who want to start reading the book, we give you this particular
Restoring Ecological Health to Your Land (The Science and Practice of Ecological Restoration Series) book
as beginner and daily reading guide. Why, because this book is more than just a book.

Susan Jun:

Reading a publication tends to be new life style on this era globalization. With looking at you can get a lot of
information that could give you benefit in your life. Using book everyone in this world could share their
idea. Ebooks can also inspire a lot of people. Lots of author can inspire their reader with their story as well as
their experience. Not only the story that share in the textbooks. But also they write about the information
about something that you need example. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach your kids, there are
many kinds of book that you can get now. The authors on this planet always try to improve their proficiency
in writing, they also doing some investigation before they write for their book. One of them is this Restoring
Ecological Health to Your Land (The Science and Practice of Ecological Restoration Series).

Shelly Reder:

Do you really one of the book lovers? If so, do you ever feeling doubt if you find yourself in the book store?
Make an effort to pick one book that you find out the inside because don't assess book by its handle may
doesn't work is difficult job because you are afraid that the inside maybe not while fantastic as in the outside
appearance likes. Maybe you answer can be Restoring Ecological Health to Your Land (The Science and
Practice of Ecological Restoration Series) why because the great cover that make you consider concerning
the content will not disappoint an individual. The inside or content is fantastic as the outside or maybe cover.
Your reading sixth sense will directly make suggestions to pick up this book.

Richard Jimenez:

Reading a guide make you to get more knowledge from this. You can take knowledge and information from
your book. Book is prepared or printed or created from each source this filled update of news. In this modern
era like today, many ways to get information are available for a person. From media social including
newspaper, magazines, science e-book, encyclopedia, reference book, book and comic. You can add your
understanding by that book. Are you hip to spend your spare time to open your book? Or just seeking the
Restoring Ecological Health to Your Land (The Science and Practice of Ecological Restoration Series) when
you required it?
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