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In the wake of a bitter presidential campaign and in the face of numerous divisive policy questions, many
Americans wonder if their country has split in two. People are passionately choosing sides on contentious
issues such as the invasion of Iraq, gay marriage, stem-cell research, and the right to die, and the battle over
abortion continues unabated. Social and political splits fascinate the media: we hear of Red States against
Blue States and the "Religious Right" against "Secular America"; Fox News and Air America; NASCAR
dads and soccer moms. Is America, in fact, divided so clearly? Does a moderate middle still exist? Is the
national fabric fraying? To the extent that these divisions exist, are they simply the healthy and unavoidable
products of a diverse, democratic nation? In Is There a Culture War? two of America's leading authorities on
political culture lead a provocative and thoughtful investigation of this question and its ramifications. James
Davison Hunter and Alan Wolfe debate these questions with verve, insight, and a deep knowledge rooted in
years of study and reflection. Long before most scholars and pundits addressed the issue, Hunter and Wolfe
were identifying the fault lines in the debate. Hunter's 1992 book Culture Wars put the term in popular
circulation, arguing that America was in the midst of a "culture war" over "our most fundamental and
cherished assumptions about how to order our lives." Six years later, in One Nation After All, Wolfe
challenged the idea of a culture war and argued that a majority of Americans were seeking a middle way, a
blend of the traditional and the modern. For the first time, these two distinguished scholars join in dialogue
to clarify their differences, update their arguments, and search for the truth about America's cultural
condition.
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From reader reviews:

Sybil Moore:

Reading a publication tends to be new life style within this era globalization. With reading through you can
get a lot of information that can give you benefit in your life. Having book everyone in this world may share
their idea. Books can also inspire a lot of people. Many author can inspire their very own reader with their
story or even their experience. Not only the storyline that share in the books. But also they write about the
knowledge about something that you need instance. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach
children, there are many kinds of book which exist now. The authors in this world always try to improve
their skill in writing, they also doing some investigation before they write for their book. One of them is this
Is There a Culture War?: A Dialogue on Values and American Public Life (Pew Forum Dialogue Series on
Religion and Public Life).

Louise Villanueva:

Spent a free a chance to be fun activity to do! A lot of people spent their sparetime with their family, or their
particular friends. Usually they performing activity like watching television, planning to beach, or picnic
within the park. They actually doing ditto every week. Do you feel it? Do you want to something different to
fill your own personal free time/ holiday? Might be reading a book could be option to fill your free time/
holiday. The first thing that you will ask may be what kinds of e-book that you should read. If you want to
try look for book, may be the book untitled Is There a Culture War?: A Dialogue on Values and American
Public Life (Pew Forum Dialogue Series on Religion and Public Life) can be very good book to read. May
be it can be best activity to you.

Martha Fincher:

Are you kind of busy person, only have 10 or perhaps 15 minute in your time to upgrading your mind
proficiency or thinking skill even analytical thinking? Then you have problem with the book compared to
can satisfy your limited time to read it because pretty much everything time you only find guide that need
more time to be study. Is There a Culture War?: A Dialogue on Values and American Public Life (Pew
Forum Dialogue Series on Religion and Public Life) can be your answer given it can be read by an individual
who have those short spare time problems.

Carlton Little:

What is your hobby? Have you heard this question when you got scholars? We believe that that question was
given by teacher to their students. Many kinds of hobby, Everyone has different hobby. And you know that
little person such as reading or as studying become their hobby. You must know that reading is very
important as well as book as to be the issue. Book is important thing to add you knowledge, except your
personal teacher or lecturer. You get good news or update concerning something by book. Many kinds of



books that can you choose to adopt be your object. One of them is Is There a Culture War?: A Dialogue on
Values and American Public Life (Pew Forum Dialogue Series on Religion and Public Life).
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