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A lyrical and evocative memoir from Frances Mayes, the Bard of Tuscany, about coming of age in the
Deep South and the region’s powerful influence on her life.

The author of three beloved books about her life in Italy, including Under the Tuscan Sun and Every Day in
Tuscany, Frances Mayes revisits the turning points that defined her early years in Fitzgerald, Georgia. With
her signature style and grace, Mayes explores the power of landscape, the idea of home, and the lasting force
of a chaotic and loving family.

From her years as a spirited, secretive child, through her university studies—a period of exquisite freedom
that imbued her with a profound appreciation of friendship and a love of travel—to her escape to a new life
in California, Mayes exuberantly recreates the intense relationships of her past, recounting the bitter and
sweet stories of her complicated family: her beautiful yet fragile mother, Frankye; her unpredictable father,
Garbert; Daddy Jack, whose life Garbert saved; grandmother Mother Mayes; and the family maid, Frances’s
confidant Willie Bell.

Under Magnolia is a searingly honest, humorous, and moving ode to family and place, and a thoughtful
meditation on the ways they define us, or cause us to define ourselves. With acute sensory language, Mayes
relishes the sweetness of the South, the smells and tastes at her family table, the fragrance of her hometown
trees, and writes an unforgettable story of a girl whose perspicacity and dawning self-knowledge lead her out
of the South and into the rest of the world, and then to a profound return home.

From the Hardcover edition.
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From reader reviews:

Donald Labelle:

Book is usually written, printed, or illustrated for everything. You can realize everything you want by a
guide. Book has a different type. To be sure that book is important matter to bring us around the world.
Adjacent to that you can your reading ability was fluently. A publication Under Magnolia: A Southern
Memoir will make you to become smarter. You can feel much more confidence if you can know about
everything. But some of you think this open or reading some sort of book make you bored. It is not make you
fun. Why they could be thought like that? Have you seeking best book or suitable book with you?

Betty Bowers:

The reserve untitled Under Magnolia: A Southern Memoir is the guide that recommended to you to read.
You can see the quality of the reserve content that will be shown to an individual. The language that author
use to explained their ideas are easily to understand. The copy writer was did a lot of exploration when write
the book, and so the information that they share for your requirements is absolutely accurate. You also might
get the e-book of Under Magnolia: A Southern Memoir from the publisher to make you far more enjoy free
time.

Pauline Lipman:

Reading a book for being new life style in this season; every people loves to study a book. When you go
through a book you can get a lot of benefit. When you read guides, you can improve your knowledge, mainly
because book has a lot of information into it. The information that you will get depend on what forms of
book that you have read. If you would like get information about your study, you can read education books,
but if you want to entertain yourself look for a fiction books, these us novel, comics, and soon. The Under
Magnolia: A Southern Memoir provide you with a new experience in examining a book.

Debra Brunette:

As a college student exactly feel bored for you to reading. If their teacher inquired them to go to the library
in order to make summary for some e-book, they are complained. Just very little students that has reading's
heart or real their hobby. They just do what the professor want, like asked to the library. They go to right
now there but nothing reading really. Any students feel that looking at is not important, boring as well as
can't see colorful pics on there. Yeah, it is to be complicated. Book is very important for you personally. As
we know that on this period, many ways to get whatever we would like. Likewise word says, many ways to
reach Chinese's country. So , this Under Magnolia: A Southern Memoir can make you experience more
interested to read.
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