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Economic change, globalization, and harmonization of European law have brought new challenges to
contract law. The contributions in this volume by prominent legal scholars deal with current trends and
perspectives in European and international contract law and their impact on the various domestic legal
systems. The compendium provides an analysis of new developments in formation of contract, performance
and remedies, consumer contract law, and the particularly controversial area of anti-discrimination law.
Experts in these fields examine the underlying legal principles and problems arising in legal practice in
common law and civil law. The essays - written in English, German, and French - are the product of a series
of lectures held in 2006 at the Center for European Private Law (CEP) at the University of MÃ¼nster,
Germany.
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From reader reviews:

Cassie Merritt:

Now a day individuals who Living in the era just where everything reachable by talk with the internet and
the resources inside it can be true or not call for people to be aware of each information they get. How a lot
more to be smart in receiving any information nowadays? Of course the correct answer is reading a book.
Reading a book can help men and women out of this uncertainty Information mainly this New Features in
Contract Law book because book offers you rich info and knowledge. Of course the details in this book
hundred per cent guarantees there is no doubt in it as you know.

Dennis Simpson:

The book New Features in Contract Law has a lot of knowledge on it. So when you check out this book you
can get a lot of profit. The book was compiled by the very famous author. Mcdougal makes some research
ahead of write this book. This specific book very easy to read you can get the point easily after reading this
article book.

Jennifer Williams:

Is it you actually who having spare time and then spend it whole day through watching television programs
or just resting on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This New Features in Contract Law can be
the answer, oh how comes? A book you know. You are and so out of date, spending your extra time by
reading in this brand-new era is common not a nerd activity. So what these books have than the others?

Cedric Barnett:

You can find this New Features in Contract Law by check out the bookstore or Mall. Simply viewing or
reviewing it could possibly to be your solve trouble if you get difficulties for ones knowledge. Kinds of this
book are various. Not only simply by written or printed but additionally can you enjoy this book by means of
e-book. In the modern era such as now, you just looking because of your mobile phone and searching what
their problem. Right now, choose your personal ways to get more information about your reserve. It is most
important to arrange yourself to make your knowledge are still change. Let's try to choose appropriate ways
for you.
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