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Essay from the year 2011 in the subject Communications - Intercultural Communication, grade: 1,3,
Stralsund University of Applied Sciences, language: English, abstract: “McDonaldization” (GeorgRitzer),
“Cocacolization” (Zdravko Mlinar) and “Mc-World” (Benjamin Barber) are just a few key words of a topic
that has gained worldwide interest today. The Globalization is on the roll and seems to be unstoppable. [1]
One by one, the world has become a ‘global village’ with multicultural societies, where it is unavoidable for
us to get in greater contact with the rest of the world and other cultures. Our daily lives develop an
increasingly international orientation. Globalization produced a demand for intercultural communication and
awareness for both the tourism industry and many different commercial sectors. The travel and tourism
industry has experienced a growing internationalization during the past decades. Especially here people are
exposed to cultural different societies. In the tourism industry it is substantial to know cultures in its various
forms and dimensions since it has a significant impact on tourism planning and development, management
and marketing. Companies in the tourism industry have to understand the influence of national cultures on
their consumers to be able to compete for market share successfully. Intercultural communication helps
tourists to keep the quality of the interaction with different nationalities high and therefore contribute to their
holiday experiences and perceptions of the visited destination. Many intercultural problems within the
tourism industry arose during the past years and are becoming more and more threatening for both the host
destinations and the tourist himself. This paper describes, analyzes and also discusses some of those
problems in the tourism industry and try to find a possible solution for them in order to eventually smoothing
the way from a global village to a global community.
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From reader reviews:

Steven Clayton:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to prepare your time to do the important take action, like
looking for your favorite book and reading a guide. Beside you can solve your short lived problem; you can
add your knowledge by the guide entitled Intercultural problems in the tourism industry. Try to the actual
book Intercultural problems in the tourism industry as your friend. It means that it can to be your friend when
you feel alone and beside those of course make you smarter than previously. Yeah, it is very fortuned in your
case. The book makes you much more confidence because you can know almost everything by the book. So ,
let's make new experience along with knowledge with this book.

Jackson Cabrera:

This Intercultural problems in the tourism industry book is not ordinary book, you have after that it the world
is in your hands. The benefit you get by reading this book will be information inside this reserve incredible
fresh, you will get information which is getting deeper you actually read a lot of information you will get.
This specific Intercultural problems in the tourism industry without we know teach the one who reading
through it become critical in contemplating and analyzing. Don't be worry Intercultural problems in the
tourism industry can bring once you are and not make your bag space or bookshelves' turn out to be full
because you can have it with your lovely laptop even telephone. This Intercultural problems in the tourism
industry having excellent arrangement in word as well as layout, so you will not feel uninterested in reading.

Rene Moore:

Many people spending their time by playing outside using friends, fun activity having family or just
watching TV all day every day. You can have new activity to shell out your whole day by reading through a
book. Ugh, you think reading a book will surely hard because you have to take the book everywhere? It all
right you can have the e-book, having everywhere you want in your Cell phone. Like Intercultural problems
in the tourism industry which is keeping the e-book version. So , try out this book? Let's see.

Michael Lockwood:

Guide is one of source of information. We can add our expertise from it. Not only for students but
additionally native or citizen require book to know the upgrade information of year to year. As we know
those ebooks have many advantages. Beside all of us add our knowledge, also can bring us to around the
world. With the book Intercultural problems in the tourism industry we can consider more advantage. Don't
someone to be creative people? For being creative person must like to read a book. Simply choose the best
book that acceptable with your aim. Don't possibly be doubt to change your life by this book Intercultural
problems in the tourism industry. You can more inviting than now.
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