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It is 1888. As Central Asia reels under the intrigues of the Great Game, Sherlock Holmes and Dr Watson sail
to India on a secret mission in the service of Empire. The accountant of a Hindu monastery has been brutally
murdered, and the head priest is the prime suspect. But as both detective and doctor soon discover, their
Indian autumn has only just begun. They are plunged into a series of adventures that take them from Madras
and Pondicherry to the princely courts of Hyderabad, the uncharted jungles of the Central Provinces, pine-
scented Nainital, and the bustling metropolis of Calcutta. Even as Holmes unravels sinister plots, Watson
busies himself helping Ronald Ross track the malaria parasite and advising a schoolboy called Dhyan Chand
on the finer points of hockey.

The six stories in Holmes of the Raj are delightful vignettes of life and politics in colonial India. Vithal
Rajan breathes life into historical characters, as Holmes and Watson meet Lord Ripon, Madame Blavatsky,
Francis Younghusband, Kipling and Kim himself, Vivekananda, Aurobindo, Ramanujan, Motilal Nehru,
Tagore, Jinnah, and many, many others. Sprightly, colourful, and remarkably faithful to Conan Doyle, this is
an unforgettable collection.
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From reader reviews:

Patrick Vanmeter:

Have you spare time for a day? What do you do when you have much more or little spare time? Yeah, you
can choose the suitable activity to get spend your time. Any person spent their own spare time to take a
move, shopping, or went to often the Mall. How about open or even read a book eligible Holmes of the Raj?
Maybe it is for being best activity for you. You know beside you can spend your time along with your
favorite's book, you can better than before. Do you agree with the opinion or you have additional opinion?

Maritza Berry:

Spent a free a chance to be fun activity to perform! A lot of people spent their down time with their family,
or their very own friends. Usually they accomplishing activity like watching television, gonna beach, or
picnic inside the park. They actually doing ditto every week. Do you feel it? Do you wish to something
different to fill your free time/ holiday? Could possibly be reading a book may be option to fill your no cost
time/ holiday. The first thing you ask may be what kinds of e-book that you should read. If you want to try
look for book, may be the reserve untitled Holmes of the Raj can be good book to read. May be it may be
best activity to you.

Cynthia Campbell:

In this age globalization it is important to someone to obtain information. The information will make
someone to understand the condition of the world. The healthiness of the world makes the information easier
to share. You can find a lot of personal references to get information example: internet, paper, book, and
soon. You can view that now, a lot of publisher in which print many kinds of book. Often the book that
recommended for you is Holmes of the Raj this e-book consist a lot of the information with the condition of
this world now. This specific book was represented how does the world has grown up. The vocabulary styles
that writer use to explain it is easy to understand. The particular writer made some research when he makes
this book. This is why this book suited all of you.

Edward Davidson:

Many people spending their period by playing outside having friends, fun activity using family or just
watching TV the whole day. You can have new activity to pay your whole day by reading a book. Ugh, do
you consider reading a book will surely hard because you have to use the book everywhere? It alright you
can have the e-book, bringing everywhere you want in your Smart phone. Like Holmes of the Raj which is
obtaining the e-book version. So , try out this book? Let's find.
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